
AWARD ON BID ON SCIENCE KIT SUPPLIES OR APPROVED EQUALS SCHOOL DISTRICT OF THE CITY OF ERIE, PA

Item # QTY                        Unit Item Description
Vendor Award 

Unit Price
Vendor Award 

Total Price
VENDOR AWARD

VENDOR TOTAL 
AWARD

8 1 Case Pail, plastic, 3 Qt; Case of 200 $760.00 $760.00 Bio Corporation

28 24 Each Prepared Slide, Hydra Budding Adult , w.m. $1.71 $41.04 Bio Corporation $801.04

21 30 Each Ultra-Velcro, Hook Strip $0.17 $5.10 Fisher Science

24 7 Each Prepared Slide, Amoeba proteus , w.m. $3.64 $25.48 Fisher Science

25 13 Each Prepared Slide, Euglena , w.m. $2.29 $29.77 Fisher Science

32 15 Pack Slide, Well, Plastic, Pack of 16 $0.78 $11.70 Fisher Science

38 20 Pack Seed, Wisconsin Fast Plants®, Pack of 200 $28.58 $571.60 Fisher Science

55 15 Pack Seeds, Alfalfa, 4 oz. $1.92 $28.80 Fisher Science

95 48 Pack
Rayovac ALAA-8J Ultra Pro Industrial AA Alkaline Batteries - 
8/Pack

$2.62 $125.76 Fisher Science

97 72 Pack
Rayovac ALD-6J Ultra Pro Industrial D Alkaline Batteries - 
6/Pack

$2.70 $194.40 Fisher Science $992.61

13 5 Pack Nut, wing, #6, Pack of 48 $7.50 $37.50 Metco Supplies

14 5 Pack Screw, Machine, #6, Pack of 48 $3.35 $16.75 Metco Supplies

59 10 Each Madison Mill Round Wood Poplar Dowel (Actual: 48-in L x 
0.25-in dia); each

$0.64 $6.40 Metco Supplies

60 10 Pack Blue Hawk Zinc-Plated S-Hook;                 pack of 6 $3.85 $38.50 Metco Supplies

61 1 Each Kobalt 14-in Bolt Cutters $28.90 $28.90 Metco Supplies

62 60 Each
United Solutions 5-Gallon Residential Bucket

$6.49 $389.40 Metco Supplies

63 60 Each
United Solutions 12.25-in Blue Plastic Bucket Lid

$2.95 $177.00 Metco Supplies

64 40 Bag Sta-Green 64-Quart Fruit Flower and Vegetable $18.89 $755.60 Metco Supplies

66 20 Bundle
 Heavy Duty Corrugated Box - 44 ECT Bundle/25 (500 total 
boxes); Dimensions: 11¹/₄ x 8³/₄ x 12"

$28.50 $570.00 Metco Supplies

67 2 Bundle Multi-Depth Heavy Duty Corrugated Box - 44 ECT; Bundle/20 
(40 total boxes; Dimensions: 26 x 20 x 20"

$133.80 $267.60 Metco Supplies

68 2 Bundle Heavy Duty Corrugated Box - 44 ECT; Bundle/20 (40 total 
boxes; Dimensions: 20 x 20 x 12"

$59.60 $119.20 Metco Supplies

69 2 Bundle Heavy Duty Corrugated Box - 44 ECT: Bundle/20 (40 total 
boxes); Dimensions:  18 x 18 x 12"

$50.20 $100.40 Metco Supplies

70 1 Case Clear Face Document Envelope - Resealable/Zipper; 
Case/1000; Dimensions: 4 x 6"

$65.90 $65.90 Metco Supplies

72 4 Case 2.5 Mil Premium Heavy Grade Clear Acrylic Carton Sealing 
Tape; Case/36 (144 rolls total); 2" x 60 yard rolls

$168.64 $674.56 Metco Supplies

73 2 Bundle 6 x 6 x 60" Corrugated Box - 32 ECT (50 total boxes) $135.00 $270.00 Metco Supplies

85 10 Each 1 Professional Automatic Wire Stripper Cutter Crimper Pliers 
Terminal Cable Tool

$13.55 $135.50 Metco Supplies

87 1 Pack
60PCS Air Pump Inflator Needle Set Basketball Football Soccer 
Sports Adapter Pin

$19.80 $19.80 Metco Supplies

88 1 Each

X-Tronic Model #3020-XTS Digital LED Display 75 Watt 
Soldering Station - 10 Minute Sleep Function, Auto Cool Down, 
C/F Switch, Side Mounted Solder Roll Holder, Brass Tip 

$99.25 $99.25 Metco Supplies

89 1 Each ZENY 2X Clamp Third Hand Soldering Solder Iron Stand 
Holder Helping Magnifier Tool

$17.40 $17.40 Metco Supplies

90 40 Pack Equate Antacid & Pain Relief Aspirin Effervescent Tablets, 325 
mg, 36 Ct

$3.40 $136.00 Metco Supplies

94 3 Each
Osmocote Smart-Release Plant Food Plus Outdoor & Indoor, 2 
lbs

$11.55 $34.65 Metco Supplies

96 60 Pack Rayovac ALAAA-8J Ultra Pro Industrial AAA Alkaline Batteries 
- 8/Pack

$3.84 $230.40 Metco Supplies
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98 3 Case 16 oz tall; clear plastic cups; Case of 1000 $96.30 $288.90 Metco Supplies

99 1 Case 3 oz wax treated white paper cup; Case of 5000 $329.80 $329.80 Metco Supplies

100 1 Case 3.5 oz transluscent plastic cups; Case of 2500 $44.40 $44.40 Metco Supplies

101 1 Case 5 oz wax treated paper cup; Case of 3000 $163.90 $163.90 Metco Supplies

102 1 Case 8 oz deli container; clear plastic; Case of 500; not transluscent $59.50 $59.50 Metco Supplies

103 4 Case 9 oz SQUAT cups; clear plastic; Case of 1000 $85.90 $85.90 Metco Supplies

104 3 Case Choice 20 oz. Clear PET Plastic Cold Cup; Case of 600 $72.75 $72.75 Metco Supplies

112 1 Case
Choice 9 oz. Translucent Thin Wall Plastic Cold Cup - 
2500/Case

$74.80 $74.80 Metco Supplies

113 5 Case
9" White Uncoated Paper Plate - 1000/Case

$34.40 $34.40 Metco Supplies $5,345.06

1 35 Set  Organisms Living Materials Order Forms  3 Coupon/Form Set $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

2 35 Set
Animals Two by Two Living Materials Order Forms 4 
Coupon/Form Set

$0.00 $0.00 No Bid

3 16 Set
Environments Living Materials Order Forms 3 Coupon/Form 
Set

$0.00 $0.00 No Bid

4 6 Set
Populations & Ecoystems Living Materials Order Forms 2 
Coupon/Form Set

$0.00 $0.00 No Bid

5 35 Set
Life Cycle of Butterflies Living Materials Order Forms 1 
Coupon/Form Set

$0.00 $0.00 No Bid

6 4 Set
Organisms—From Macro To Micro  Living Materials Order 
Forms 5 Coupon/Form Set

$0.00 $0.00 No Bid

7 1 Case
Tank, Plastic, 1-1/2 gal; Case of 120 Outside dimensions: 12" x 
7 3/4" x 4 3/4"; rectangular

$0.00 $0.00 No Bid

9 15 Packs Cardboard Strip, 1.5 x 9cm, Pack of 30 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

11 4 Pack Motor, DC, Pack of 16 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

12 4 Pack Motor, Electric, with Leads, Pack of 12 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

16 10 Pack Bag-O-Stugg II, Pack of 10 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

17 30 Pack Cup, plastic, 9 oz., with 1 Large Hole; Pack of 8 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

18 30 Pack Cup, plastic, 9 oz., with 1 Small Hole; Pack of 8 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

19 30 Pack Cup, plastic, 9 oz., with 3 Small Holes; Pack of 8 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

23 15 Each Hay, 8 x 10-in Bag $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

27 13 Each Prepared Slide, Ciliates, Paramecium , w.m. $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

29 24 Each Prepared Slide, WOWbug , w.m. $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
37 40 Set Tray, Planter, with lid $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

39 40 Pack Water Mat, pack of 3 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

40 40 Pack Wick, Pack of 144 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

41 40 Pack Label, Planter, pack of 36 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

42 40 Pack Ring, Planter, Pack of 34 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

43 2 Set Board Set, Sun-Earth-Moon $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

44 30 Pack Shoelace, white, pack of 31 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

57 2 Set
Bulk Digital Up/Down                            Student Timers;  100 Pcs 
200 total times; use AAA batteries

$0.00 $0.00 No Bid
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58 1 Pack

GE 34-Watt 48-in Medium Bi-pin (T12) 4100 K Cool White 
Fluorescent Light Bulb (30-Pack) T12 Fluorescent Bulbs;              
Bi-pin

$0.00 $0.00 No Bid

65 1 Pallet
Pallet of 120 Heavy-Duty Plastic Totes; Blue; Dimensions: 21 
7/8" x 15 1/4" x 9 11/16"

$0.00 $0.00 No Bid

71 4 Case
1.7 Mil Strong and Sticky™ Clear Acrylic Carton Sealing Tape; 
Case/36 (144 rolls); 2" x 55 yard rolls

$0.00 $0.00 No Bid

86 20 Bags (5 Pack) Jet-Puffed Miniature Marshmallows, 16 oz Bag $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

91 1 Pack Uxcell 200 Pcs Silver Tone Metal Electric Test Probe Crocodile 
Alligator Clips Clamps

$0.00 $0.00 No Bid

92 27 Pack
Nabisco Chips Ahoy! Chewy Cookies Family Size, 19.5 Oz. 
(approx. 1000 cookies)

$0.00 $0.00 No Bid

93 1 Case Buy Bulk: Scotch Transparent Tape in Hand Dispenser, 1/2'' x 
450'', Clear,(Case of 144)

$0.00 $0.00 No Bid

105 2 Case
Straws, jumbo (total of 24,000 straws) : clear, unwrapped, 
drinking straws; 7 3/4" long with 1/4" diameter

$0.00 $0.00 No Bid

106 2 Case
Straws, super jumbo (15,000 total straws); red and white 
striped; 7 3/4" long with 5/16" diameter

$0.00 $0.00 No Bid

107 3 Case Nabisco 10 lb. Homestyle Chocolate Chip Cookies; Case of 360 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

108 2 Each One-Piece Aluminum Scoop - 38 oz. $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

109 1 Each One-Piece Aluminum Scoop - 85 oz. $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

110 8 Case Choice 9, 12, 16, 20, and 24 oz. Clear Flat Lid with Straw Slot - 
1000/Case

$0.00 $0.00 No Bid

111 1 Case
Choice 9 oz. Clear Cold Cup Flat Lid with Straw Slot - 
2000/Case

$0.00 $0.00 No Bid

45 60 Each Thermometer, glass, -10 - 110C; Must be 8" $3.05 $183.00 School Specialty

46 30 Pack Cardboard squares, 10 cm (4") (65/pkg.) $4.78 $143.40 School Specialty

47 5 Set Fabric squares, satin, blue, 10 cm (4") (set of 10) $2.09 $10.45 School Specialty

48 5 Set Fabric squares, seersucker, blue, 10 cm (4") (set of 10) $2.15 $10.75 School Specialty

49 5 Set Fabric squares, terry cloth, blue, 10 cm (4") (set of 10) $2.65 $13.25 School Specialty

50 60 Bag Soil, 4 lb. bag $4.76 $285.60 School Specialty

51 15 Bag Gravel, 5 lb. bag; fine, white gravel $9.11 $136.65 School Specialty

52 15 Pack Seeds, Rye Grass, 4 oz. $2.01 $30.15 School Specialty

54 15 Pack Seeds, Sunflower, raw, shelled, 7 oz. $1.73 $25.95 School Specialty

74 10 Set EISCO Painted Blue And Red Bar Magnets, Chrome Steel $1.84 $18.40 School Specialty

75 15 Each
School Smart Washable School Glue, 1 Gallon Bottle, White

$5.29 $79.35 School Specialty

76 5 Pack
School Smart Push Pin for Bulletin Boards, 3/8 in L, 1/2 in 
Head, Plastic Head/Steel Point, Assorted Color, Pack of 100

$0.51 $2.55 School Specialty

77 6 Pack Medline Latex-Free Non-Sterile Tongue Blade, 6 in, Wood, 
Pack of 500

$7.38 $44.28 School Specialty

78 30 Pack
School Health Non-Sterile Cotton Ball, Medium, Pack of 2000

$8.24 $247.20 School Specialty

79 40 Pack
Paper, Construction, Light Blue, Sunworks,  9 x 12 in, Pack of 
50 Sheets 

$0.66 $26.40 School Specialty

80 40 Pack
Paper, Construction, White, 9 x 12 in, Sunworks, Pack of 50 
Sheets 

$0.67 $26.80 School Specialty

83 1 Each
School Smart Kraft Envelope with Clasp, 12 x 15-1/2 Inches, 
Pack of 100; Dimensions:  12 x 15 1/2 "

$13.82 $13.82 School Specialty $1,298.00

10 100 Box Baking Soda, 16 oz box $0.97 $97.00 Ward's Science
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15 8 Each Holder, Clamp, V-Jaw, Small $3.30 $26.40 Ward's Science

20 30 Each Tape, Electrical, Roll $0.95 $28.50 Ward's Science

22 80 Each Flight Cage, Large $4.94 $395.20 Ward's Science

26 4 Each Prepared Slide, Volvox , w.m. $4.31 $17.24 Ward's Science

30 9 Each Prepared Slide, Human Stratified Squamous Epithelium , smear $3.23 $29.07 Ward's Science

31 20 Each Prepared Slide, Mammal Nueron Motor Nerve Cells , smear $6.47 $129.40 Ward's Science

33 10 Pack Slide, Concavity, Student-Quality, Pack of 12 $4.04 $40.40 Ward's Science

34 6 Pack Cannister with hinged lid, 1-1/2 oz., Pack of 2 $0.38 $2.28 Ward's Science

35 60 Each Yeast, Powder, 100 g (6,000 grams total) $4.49 $269.40 Ward's Science

36 40 Pack Seed, Sunflower, Pack of 60 $0.93 $37.20 Ward's Science

53 15 Pack Seeds, Wheat, 2 oz. $1.84 $27.60 Ward's Science

56 30 Pack Sponges; pack of 8 $1.12 $33.60 Ward's Science

81 60 Each
Eveready General Purpose LED Flashlight

$1.15 $69.00 Ward's Science

82 2 Each Heathrow Cork Lined Slide Box, Holds 100 Slides $3.83 $7.66 Ward's Science

84 6 Pack
3.0V 200MA SOLAR CELL WITH WIRES 10-PACK

$6.64 $39.84 Ward's Science $1,249.79

TOTAL BID AWARD $9,686.50 $9,686.50


